10.

Name of Procuring Agency

Method of Procurement

Title of Procurement

Tender Inquiry No.

PPRA Ref. No. (TSE)

Date & Time of Bid Closing

Di

Evaluation Report

(As per Rule 35 of Public Procurement Rules, 2017)

D

OMP

INGH
E Sin
24-
ted: 03-05- £
4

L AK

re)j.

Date & Time of Bid Opening -05- 1:
No. of Bids Received 03
Criteria for Bid Evaluation NAN
Details of Bid (s) Evaluation AS UNDER
S.# | Name of Bidder Marks Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
: » z : Policy/acceptance as per
Iff::’,fs'“] e Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
: Rules 2017
01 | M/S Ali & Brothers 83 N/A Without Gas Per Patient  567-13 | 1¥ Lowest Responsive
Shopping Center Nangi Bidder
Sector B/1 Mirpur(A.K) With Gas Per Patient 600-26 ]
02 | M/S 3 Star Traders 77 N/A Without Gas Per Patient  601-52 | 2™ Lowest Responsive
General Suppliers Bidder
House No 102R Sector With Gas Per Patient 635-05
B/4 Mirpur (A.K)
03 | M/S Waseem Traders 70 N/A Without Gas Per Patient 614-44 | 3™ Lowest Responsive
Distributors & Bidder
Suppliers of Gods 588 With Gas Per Patient  648-36
Shopping Center
|| Mirpur(A.K)

Lowest Evaluated Bidder:-
M/S Ali & Brothers Shopping Center Nangi Sector B/1 Mirpur on the basis of Lowest
Rate of Diet per patient per Day Rs.567-13 and During Load shedding of Sui gas per patient per Day Rs.600-26

during the F.Y 2024-25.

*

Medical Superintendent
Div.HQs.Teaching Hospital Mirpur.



10.

w Evaluati
(As per Rule 35 of Public Procurement Rules, 2017)

Name of Procuring Agency IVISIO T 1

Method of Procurement N DDING e o rocedure

Title of Procurement General Medicines F.Y 2023-24

Tender Inquiry No. -MR-139-N-5-2 d: 03-05-2024

PPRA Ref, No. (TSE) D -05-

Date & Time of Bid Closing -05-2024

Date & Time of Bid Opening Z.I:QS_-ZQZ&JL&QAM

No. of Bids Received 02

Criteria for Bid Evaluation FINANCIAL

Details of Bid (s) Evaluation AS Under

[ 7 ltemNo.01 ibuprofen Tab.400mg(film/Sugar Coated)Blister Pack of 250 o ess ey, )

S. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB

# alMarks | IMarks | Qty Rate Amount | D%/
Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules 2017

01 | M/SMYS Distributors 92 N/A 5000 2.55 12,750/- Most Advantageous

Opp Pwd Office Hajira Bid
Bypass Road Rawalakot
Poonch B
02 | M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 5000 456 22,800/- 2™ Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No
562 Phase [ Wah Cant
Rawalpindi

M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)

[ Item No.02Z Ibuprofen Syp/Oral Liquid 10 Sml.Bottle of 90ml or less
S. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB
# al Marks | | Marks D#/
Qty Rate Amount | Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules ,2017
01 | M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 5000 45.50 227,500/- Most Advantageous
Distributors House No Bid
562 Phase I Wah Cant X
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors 92 N/A 5000  76-00 760,000/~ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Opp Pwd Office Hajira
Bypass Road Rawalakot
Poonch

M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi

(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)




-

Item No.03 Diclofenac Sodium Tab.100mg(enteric Coated)Blister Pack of 20

S. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB
i al Marks | 1 Marks D*/
Qty Rate Amount | Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules 2017
01 M/S MYS Distributors 92 N/A 10000  3-00 30,000/- | Most Advantageous
Opp Pwd Office Hajira Bid
Bypass Road Rawalakot
Poonch
02 | M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 10000 3.38 33,800/~ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No
562 Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch
(1" Lowest responsive Bidder)
Item No.04 Chlorpheniramine maleate Tab.100mg(enteric Coated)Blister Pack of 20
S. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB
# al Marks | | Marks | Qty Rate  Amount D*/
Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules ,2017
01 | M/SKashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 20000 0464 9,280/~ | Most Advantageous
Distributors House No Bid
562 Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 M/S MYS Distributors 92 N/A 20000 3-00 60,000/~ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Opp Pwd Office Hajira
Bypass Road Rawalakot
Poonch

M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi

(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)

Item No.05 Chlorpheniramine Syp(as maleate)2mg/5ml.Bottle of 60ml

S. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB
o2 al Marks | | Marks | Qty Rate Amount | D*/
Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules ,2017
01 | M/S Kashmir Pharma & i N/A 5000 3645 182,250/~ | Most Advantageous
Distributors House No Bid
562 Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 M/S MYS Distributors 92 NIA 5000 56-00 280,000/~ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Opp Pwd Office Hajira
Bypass Road Rawalakot /
Poonch

J

M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1" Lowest responsive Bidder)

]




_Item No.06 _ Cetirizine Syp Img/ml Bottle of 60ml Above
v 5. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB
# al Marks | 1 Marks | Qty Rate D*/
Amount Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules ,2017
01 | M/S Kashmir Pharma & T N/A 2000 36.80 73,600/~ | Most Advantageous
Distributors House No Bid
562 Phase 1 Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 M/S MYS Distributors 92 N/A 2000 56-00 112,000/~ | 2" Advantageous Bid
Opp Pwd Office Hajira
Bypass Road Rawalakot
Poonch
M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi )
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)

Item No.07 Amoxicillin Cap/Tab(as Trihydrate)500mg Blister/Aluminum Strip Pack of 10 or less
S. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB
# al Marks | | Marks | Qty Rate Amount | D/
Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules ,2017
01 M/S MYS Distributors 92 N/A 5000 13-00 65,000/~ | Most Advantageous
Opp Pwd Office Hajira Bid
Bypass Road Rawalakot
Poonch
02 | M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 5000 14.05 70,250/~ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No
562 Phase  Wah Cant
Rawalpindi +
M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch
(1" Lowest responsive Bidder)

Item No.08 Diamenhydernate Syp.12.5mg/5ml Bottle of 60ml Individually Packed in Cartion
S. | Name of Bidder Technic | Financia Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SB
# al Marks | | Marks | Qty Rate Amount D*/
Policy/acceptance as
per Rules 35 of AJK
PPRA Rules ,2017
01 | M/S Kashmir Pharma & 71 N/A 2000 4420 88,400/~ | Most Advantageous
Distributors House No Bid
562 Phase 1 Wah Cant
Rawalpindi .
02 | M/SMYS Distributors 92 N/A 2000 64-00 128,000/ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Opp Pwd Office Hajira ‘
Bypass Road Rawalakot
Poonch
M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1*' Lowest responsive Bidder)




¥ Item No.09 Sulbutamol Oral Liquid (Sulafe)2mg/5ml Bottle of 60ml Packed in Cartion

S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK FPRA
Rules ,2017
01 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 1000 39.50 39,500/~ Most Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562
Phase 1 Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 1000 46-00 46,000/- o Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch
M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)
v Item No.10 Isoflurane 100ml -
5.4 | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules ,2017
01 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 200 3760 752,000/- Most Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562 Bin, est Quality
Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 200 3760 752,000/~ o Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch

M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1" Lowest responsive Bidder)

v _Item No.11 Inj. Ketamin Hydrochloride 50mg/ml

S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules ,2017
01 M/S Kashmir Pharma & L N/A NQ
Distributors House No 562
Phase 1 Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A N/Q
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass

Road Rawalakot Poonch




= v Ttem No.12 Inj. Propofol 200mg

5.4 | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules ,2017
o1 M/5 Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 100 527 52,700/- Most Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562
Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 100 560 56,000/~ 2" Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch
M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)
v Item No.13 Inj.ARV Anti Rabies (Venom)
S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules 2017
01 M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 200 1445 289,000/~ Most Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Ra kot Poonch
02 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 200 2250 450,000/- 2% Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562
Phase | Wah Cant
Rawalpindi

M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)

Item No.14 1Inj. Verapamin As Hydrochloride 2.5mg/ml.2mlAmp Pack of 5 Amp

S# | Name of Bidder Technical | Finaneial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
: Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK FPRA
Rules ,2017
01 M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A . | 300 37.18 11,154 Most Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass Single Responsive Bidder
Road Rawalakot Poonch

M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch
(Single Responsive Bidder)

Item No.15 1nj. Isosorbidinitrate

nj. Img/ml. Amp of 10ml

S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Oty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules ;2017
01 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 300 235.50 70,650/~ Most Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562
Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 300 272.00 81,600/~ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch

M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)




-

v _Item No.16 Inj. Amidaronc _Inj.150mg/3ml

S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules 2017
01 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 400 60.83 24.332/- Most Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562
Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 400 74.92 37,460/~ 2 Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch
M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)
v'_Item No.17 Cephradine Powder for oral liquid 250mg/5ml Bottle of 60ml Individually Packed in Carton ]
S.# | Name of Bidder Technieal | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules 2017
01 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 2000 239 478,000/ Most Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch
02 M/S Kashmir, Pharma & 77 N/A 2000 257.55 515,100/- 2™ Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562
Phase [ Wah Cant
Rawalpindi

M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch
(1* Lowest responsive Bidder)

Item No.18 Metronidazole Oral liquid (as benzoate)200me/Sml Bottle of 60m!

S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules 2017
01 | M/SMYS Distributors Opp 922 N/A 1500  58-00 87,000/~ | Most Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass Single Responsive Bidder
Road Rawalakot Poonch

M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch
(Single Responsive Bidder)

Item No.19 Dimenhydrinate Syp.12.5mg/5ml.Bottle of 60mLIndividually Packed in Cartion

S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Reguiation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Oty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules ,2017
01 M/S Kashmir Pharma & i N/A 4000 44.20 176,800/~ | Most Advantageous Bid
Distributors House No 562
Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A | 4000 64 256,000/~ | 2™ Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch

M/S Kashmir Phrama & Distributors Rawalpindi
(1" Lowest responsive Bidder)




Item No.20 ORS Sodium Chloride Potassium,Sodium Citrate Dextrose Aolrydrous

S# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules ,2017
01 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A 4000 16-00 64,000/~ Most Advantageous Bid
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch
02 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A 4000 20-00 80,000/~ 2™ Advantageous Bid

Distributors House No 562
Phase | Wah Cant
Rawalpindi

M/S MYS Distributors Rawalakot Poonch

(1** Lowest responsive Bidder)

Item No.21 Sodium Phosphate(Enema) Liquid Sodium Phesphate 19-2gm Sodium Phosphate 7.2gm Contents in 120ml 4.50gm
Bottle of 120ml e Nozzal

S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules ,2017
o1 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 7 N/A NIQ
Distributors House No 562
Phase [ Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/S MYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A N/Q
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch
Item No.22 Adrenaline Inj (As hydrochloride 1mg/ml Ampoule of 1ml
S.# | Name of Bidder Technical | Financial Evaluated Cost Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
Marks Marks Qty Rate Amount Policy/acceptance as per
Rules 35 of AJK PPRA
Rules 2017
01 M/S Kashmir Pharma & 77 N/A N/Q
Distributors House No 562
Phase I Wah Cant
Rawalpindi
02 | M/SMYS Distributors Opp 92 N/A N/Q
Pwd Office Hajira Bypass
Road Rawalakot Poonch
inten

Div.HQs. Teaching Hospital Mirpur.




10.

Evaluation Report

(As per Rule 35 of Public Procurement Rules, 2017)

Name of Procuring Agency LH AC TAL MIRP K

Method of Procurement MP. 1 D in ta, ce

Title of Procurement Ration Diet 2024-25

Tender Inquiry No. K-MR-139-N-5- d: 03-05-

PPRA Ref, No. (TSE) at -05-

Date & Time of Bid Closing -05-2024 11;

Date & Time of Bid Opening 2-05-2024 11:30

No. of Bids Received 04

Criteria for Bid Evaluation TECHNICAL

Details of Bid (s) Evaluation As Under

IT?..# Name of Bidder Marks 4‘ Rules/Regulation/SBD*/
. = s Policy/acceptance as per Rules 35
L‘::'If;“' :;::::‘“' of AJK PPRA Rules 2017
01 M/S 3 Star Traders Nangi Mirpur 77 N/A Qualified
02 M/S Ali & Brothers Shopping Center 83 NIA Qualified
Nangi B/1 Mirpur

03 M/S Waseem Traders Nangi Mirpur 70 N/A Qualified

04 M/S Chinnar Traders F/1 Mirpur 30 N/A Not qualified because The Firm does
not fulfill the basic condition No.6 of
Tender notice and Failed in Technical

Evaluation Criteria.

e

di intendent

Div.HQs.Teaching Hospital Mirpur.




10.

Name of Procuring Agency
Method of Procurement
Title of Procurement
Tender Inguiry No.

PPRA Ref. No. (TSE)

Evaluation Report

(As per Rule 35 of Public Procurement Rules, 2017)

DIVISI ART! CHING H MIRP
P DDING (Si I

AJK-MR-139-N-5-24 Dated: 03-05-2024

Date & Time of Bid Closing 21-05-2024 11:00 AM
Date & Time of Bid Opening 21-05-2024 11:30 AM
No. of Bids Received 0z
Criteria for Bid Evaluation TECHNICAL
Details of Bid (s) Evaluation As Under
S4# | Name of Bidder Marks Rul.eszegulatinnJSBD".f
Tedhial [Manncal | O R
01 | M/S MYS Distributor Rawalakot AJK 92 N/A Qualified
02 M/S Kashmir Pharma & Distributors 77 N/A Qualified
Wah Cannt Taxila Rwp

—

Medical Superintendent
Div.HQs.Teaching Hospital Mirpur.




